
Edenfield Gardens, Worcester Park



Guide Price £950,000

• Substantial Family Home Over 2000 sq ft

• Ample Driveway With Integral Garage

• Entrance Hallway and Downstairs Cloakroom

• Separate Living Room With Bay Window

• Impressive Kitchen/Dining/Family Room

• Stunning Conservatory End Overlooking Garden

• Master Bedroom With Stylish Ensuite Shower

Room

• Four Further Good Sized Bedrooms

• Level and Secluded Landscaped Rear Garden

• Highly Regarded Area Close To Shadbolt Park

Freehold

A fantastic opportunity to acquire this imposing semi detached
family home situated within a rarely available residential road
in a sought after area of Worcester Park. The property enjoys
easy access to Shadbolt Park and Worcester Park high street and
railway station and is in the catchment area for many
outstanding local schools.

This cleverly extended home offers generous and flexible
accommodation, with an impressive layout that is perfect for
entertaining, social occasions and most importantly, day to day
family life. In short, the property itself mirrors the superb
location.

As soon as you step into the welcoming entrance hall, the
wonderful feel of this house is immediately evident, with
accommodation that flows perfectly and makes the most of the
natural light. 

The property benefits from impressive living space with a

separate living room which is centred around a lovely fireplace
and a large bay window which is fitted with bespoke wooden
shutters. 

The star of the show is the stunning kitchen/dining/family room
with a beautiful conservatory end which makes the most of the
landscaped rear garden. These rooms all blend together to
provide the ultimate living space and from a practical viewpoint,
this home also delivers with the addition of a handy downstairs
cloakroom. 

A staircase leads to the first floor landing where the spacious
accommodation continues. There are four generously sized
bedrooms all serviced by a modern family bathroom and there is
a stylish ensuite to the master bedroom. The second floor has an
19ft guest bedroom with an ensuite cloakroom and ample eaves
storage, the perfect space for teenagers or visiting guests. 

The outside of the property doesn't disappoint either with a

generous frontage providing parking for several cars leading to
an integral garage and a landscaped rear garden that benefits
from a South/Westerly facing aspect.

Worcester Park offers a large choice of amenities including a
Waitrose, banks/building societies and other essential stores, as
well as a variety of restaurants, Worcester Park also offers great
access to public transport. Kingston which offers a more
comprehensive range of shopping is just a short drive away.

The property is within walking distance of both Stoneleigh and
Worcester Park mainline rail stations with regular services to
London and both the M25 and A3 are easily accessible, giving a
straight forward route to London and both Heathrow and
Gatwick international airports, making this property ideal for a
commuter too.

Tenure - Freehold

Council tax band - F










